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SL Ward |Est. Cost )
: arKs
N1° : Name of Work No. |(in lakh) %‘
Construction of Road from Tikeswar Bag to Sankar Mishra house in W. No. -01. 1 6.37 Na
2 |Construction of Road from Khirod Kisan to Devanand Kisan in W. No. -01. 1 6.61 No Bid
3 Cpnstruction of Road from Kulamani Pradhan house to Goutam Budha house, 1 5.57 No Bid
Kisanpada in W. No. -01
4 |Construction of Road from Kamal Kisan house to Krushna Chandra Kisan house, | 1 5.57 No Bid
Kisanpada in W. No. -01.
5 |Construction of Road from Jasmin Tailor Centre to Bagarpada Bsanta Sahu 1 6.6 No Bid
house at Goudpada in W. No. -01.
6 |Construction of Road from Bramahnand Koudi house to Satrughan Gardia house 1 5.06 No Bid
Guodpada in W. No. -01.
7 |Construction of Road from Mantu Panda house to Mauli Gudi main lane in W. | 1 9.18
No. -01.(Phase 1)
: No Bid
8 |Construction of Road from Mantu Panda house to Mauli Gudi main lane in W. | 1 9.18
No. -01. (Phase 2)
9 |Construction of Road from Md Ali house to Sarbahal Pond main lane in W. No. -| 1 13.09 No Bid
01.
10 |Construction of Road from Pintu Lenka house to Gudakesh Mishra house main 1 11.89 No Bid
lane in W. No. -01.
11 |Construction of Paver Block Road from Saroj Munda House to Dhipada Main 2 9.18
Road behind Swarup Garden at Ward No. 02. (Phase-1) Single
12 |Construction of Paver Block Road from Saroj Munda House to Dhipada Main | 2 9.18 Tender
Road behind Swarup Garden at Ward No. 02. (Phase-2)
13 [Construction of Paver Block Road from Dukhu Kashyap house to Dolchand 2 10.69 No Bid
Kisan house Colonypada Ward No. 02.
14 |Construction of Paver Block Road from Nanu Munda Sukdeb Munda house near | 2 8.76 No Bid
Saraswati Club Ward No. 02,
15 [Construction of Paver Block Road from Chand Munda house to Ganesh Munda | 2 8.12 No Bid
house Ward No. 02.
16 |Construction of Paver Block Road from Biju Das house to Prashant Munda 2 15 No Bid |
house at Dhipapada in W. No. -02. (Phase-02)
17 |Construction of Road from Sarberna Transfomer to Billung house in Ward No. 7 717 No Bid
07.
18 |Construction of Road from Ganapati Studio to Maheswar Naik house in Ward 7 8.76
No. 07 (Housing Board). (Phase-01) .
19 |Construction of Road from Ganapati Studio to Maheswar Naik house in Ward | 7 8.76 Mo Bid
No. 07 (Housing Board). (Phase-02)
20 |Const. of Paver Road from Alpana Fitness Zone to B.K Choudhury, Babi Meher | 9 14 .99 No Bid
House to Nabeen Sa and Banjara Babu house to Bhananda Naik House in Gali
No. -08 at Bijunagar in W. No. 09. _
21 |Improvement of Road from Prem Kindo house to Alex Kujur house and Bhola | 9 14 4 No Bid
Babu house to Nityananda Bhainsa house in Gali No. 14,Biju Nagar in W. No. -
09.
22 |Improvement of Road from Biswal Babu house to Dr. Pattnaik house in W, No. -| g 7.35 No Bid
09.
23 [Improvement of Road from Mucha Urmal house to Bharat Urnal house at | 12 8.36 No Bid
Harijanpada in Ward No. 12.
24 |Construction of Kacha and WBM Road from Sandip Sharma house to Laxman | 16 6.46 No Bid
Naik house at Luhurapada in Ward No. 16.
25 |Construction of Kacha and WBM Road in front of Sumant Saha house till Pond 16 5.05 No Bid
at Gayatri Bihar in Ward No. 16. L
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o af 26 |Construction of Kacha ang WBM R :
. Lf . oad atlce Cream Factory Galiin Ward No. 16 16 | 9286 | NoBid
f . | Construction of Road from —
4 BJD Office to Rajvi house in W. No. -17. (Phase-01) 17 8.67
- | 28 |Construction of Road f — : No Bid
rom BJD Office to Rajvi house in W. No. -17. (Phase-02) 17 8.67
| 29 |Construction of R -
' INo. 17, 0ad from Munu Pandey house to Krushna Pandey house in W. | 17 8.33 No Bid
' 30 |Construction of Road from Sethi house to Nawal Sa house in Ward No. 21. | 21 7.87
_ ,zP 1ase-01) o
=y - No Bid
| 31 ‘Construction of Road from Sethi house to Nawal Sa house in Ward No. | 21 7.87 i
. 21.(Phase-02)
[ 32 g;:owstmct;on of Road from Tiwari house to Choudhury Colony in Ward No. 21. | 21 8.58
[{(Phase-01)
== 1 - No Bid
i 33 g;onstrd ction of Road from Tiwari house to Choudhury Colony in Ward No. 21. | 21 8.58
nase-02)
- 34 Construction of Road from Kalin Sa house to Sajjan Sahu Ashok Mishra house | 21 8.23
t Szhzni house at Tetelmal in Ward No. 21. (Phase-01)
- 35 Construction of Road from Kalin Sa house to Sajjan Sahu Ashok Mishra house | 21 8.23 No Bic
‘to Szhani house at Tetelmal in Ward No. 21.(Phase-02)
| 36 EC nstruction of Road from Udhav Pradhan house to Udya Pradhan house at | 21 8.06
i T teimal in Ward No. 21. (Phase-01)
L No Bid
| 37 C nstruction of Road from Udhav Pradhan house to Udya Pradhan house at | 21 8.06 °
; Tetnlmal in Ward No. 21. (Phase-02)
"33 £Consu'uctlon of Road from Malati Pandey house to Kundan Allo house in Ward | 21 9.25
1z‘No. 21 (Phase-01) No Bid
21 | 9.25 e

L 39

'Construction of Road from Malati Pandey house to Kundan Allo house in Ward
INo. 21 (Phase-02)
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